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0 Outlook

RE: Greetings - Has Contract Number 24-96531-002 been executed?

From Moore, Lena (COM) <lena.moore@commerce.wa.gov>
Date Thu 8/14/2025 9:31 AM
To  john martin <jmartinnoj@hotmail.com>

Mr. Martin, to date, this contract has not been executed.

Lena

From: john martin <jmartinnoj@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 12, 2025 8:53 AM

To: Moore, Lena (COM) <lena.moore@commerce.wa.gov>

Subject: Greetings - Has Contract Number 24-96531-002 been executed?

External Email

Has Contract Number 24-96531-002 been executed?

From: john martin <jmartinnoj@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, August 8, 2025 11:16 AM

To: Lena (COM)" <lena.moore@commerce.wa.gov>
Subject: Greetings

Lena Moore

Program Manager

Washington State Department of Commerce
360-764-0632
Lena.Moore@commerce.wa.gov

Dear Lena Moore,

The attached pdf file is for your information.

| received it from the Department of Commerce as a reply to a Public Records Request

[Records Center] PUBLIC RECORD REQUEST :: P001836-051225

Regarding

"City of Everett: Old Name: Everett School District: Everett Memorial Stadium New Stadium (New name

approved in ESSB 5949, Section 1035)
Awarded $7,400,000

https://outlook.live.com/mail/0/id/AAKALgGAAAAAAHY QDEapmEc2byACqAC%2FEWgG0AYVeE0d48KOW6Y6rUupKUa1gAlcAn8mwAA 12
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Funds have been awarded; contract has not been executed"

Has the "Old Name: Everett School District: Everett Memorial Stadium New Stadium (New name
approved in ESSB 5949, Section 1035)" contract shown above been executed?

Has the contract shown above been executed?

| look forward to hearing from you at your earliest convenience.
Best Regards,

John E. Martin

425-361-2854
jmartinnoj@hotmail.com
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